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CLUSTERED LEPROSY CASES IN SOUTH
INDIA

J.Arockiasaniv, S.Balasubramanian, Hayasree, Alui
Danil Raj, N.Venkatesan,

D.Auguseitt, T.Subba Ruo & M.D.Gupte

Controlled, double blind, randomized, prophylactic
leprosy vaccine trial was conducted in South India in
an endemic area for leprosy, covering 48 panchayats
comprising of 264 contiguous villages and 3,00,000
people from Sriperumbudur and Kaneheepuram taluks
of Chingleput district (old), Tamil Nadu, South índia.

Intake for the study was completed in two and half
years from January 1991. After enumeration, the popu-
lation in the study arca was screened for leprosy by
paramedical workers trained in leprosy. Ali suspects
and cases identitied by the paramedical workers were
examined by one of the senior workers for confirma-
tion of diagnosis. Two resurveys were carried out, the
first one starting immediately after completion of vac-
cination and the second one starting two years after
completion of the first resurvey. The procedures used
in the resurveys were generally similar to the intake.

A total of 6486 cases of leprosy were diagnosed after
examining 2,55,777 individuais at intake. In the first
resurvey, 625 incidence cases were detected. In the
second resurvey, 413-cases were detected and 41 of
these cases were not examined in the first resurvey.
Analysis of prevalence and incidenee rate was done for
ali the panchayats and panchayat unions. Clustering of
ineidence cases was examined and reported in this paper.
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AN INVESTIGATION OF LIVING STYLE
PATTERN AND BEHAVIOUR OF THE
FAMILIES OF LEPROSY PATIENTS

Saneei R.Qamra & Haresh Kunuir Central JALMA
Institute For Leprosy. Agra

The living style pattern and behaviour of the leprosy
families has been understood through patients attend-
ing OPD of the CJIL to observe role. if any, in trans-
mitting leprosy to other family members. Out of 100
patients studied for this, 30 patients were belonging to
those families, where more than one leprosy case exist
and were categorized as Present Group . Remaining 70
patients did not have any other case in their families
than self and categorized as Absent Group.

50% families from Present Group resides in crowded

kachlta house compared to Absent Group (27%). 70-
80% families of both the groups were using common
soap, towel, clothes and beddings etc. before their
family members acquire leprosy but higher percentage
of patients of the absent group (40%) after contracting
leprosy stopped sharing compared to present group
(20%). Similar findings were observed in terms of
sharing foods, utensils and water.

53% and 33% of the studied patients have disclosed
about leprosy to families and community respectively.
Further. the literate patients had signiticantly hidden
the disease more compared to illiterate patients. In the
absent group, marital relation with leprosy aftlicted
spouse either reported to be disturbed or distance is
mai ntained. However. indifferent behaviour among
family members was almost negligible in present
group. Ou the other hand, 70% of the patients, who
disclosed their disease, told that community people do
not interact with us.

Thus the findings of the study suggest that repeated
contacts with leprosy patients promote transmission of
leprosy to others and initial isolation at family levet
with understanding may probably help reducing trans-
mission.
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ANALYSIS OF EPIDEMILOGICAL FINDINGS
OF MLEC I AND MLEC II IN TRIBAL
DISTRICTS IN ORISSA

B.R.Mahaparra,^& R.A.Bhuskade Secun-
derabad

Koraput Leprosy Project (KORALEP) of LEPRA India
covering a population of 1.5 million in tribal distriets in
Orissa was established in 1991. The population is pre-
dominantly tribal and the arca is vast and the 6096 vil-
lages are mostly located in difficult to reach arcas.
14201 cases were recorded and treated with MDT.

MLEC was implemented in the project arca in 1998 and
2000. Active case search was adopted in both cam-
paigns. Staff of Koralep and PHCs. Anganwadi workers
and local volunteers were drafted to conduct MLEC.

1543 cases were recorded in I MLEC while in II MLEC
509 cases were recorded. Analysis of cases recorded as
per type, age, sex, disability status has been made both
for cases detected during MLEC and in the intervening
period by the active and passive inethods of cases find-
ing in the project. Interesting distribution trends of the
disease, particularly in relation to gender, were observetl.
These trends and the possible reasons for trend differ-
ences are analysed and discussed.
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EPIDEMIOLOGICAL ASSESSMENT OF
MONOLESION LEPROSY CASES

V.G.Mathew DEllelen Rabiais The Leprosy Mis-
Sion, Calcutta

INTRODUCTION:

The epidemiological signilicance of the mono lesion
cases is not completely understood till toclay. It is ob-
served that the disease often starts with a single lesion.

OBJECTIVE:

The objective of this study is to determine the epi-
demiological factors and to determine the best mode of
early detection for the control programme especially in
the urban set up.

DESIGN, PARTICIPANTS AND SETTING:

A retrospective analysis of 308 mono lesion cases reg-
istered at Calcutta urban leprosy control programme of
The Leprosy Mission during the year 1998 -1999.

MAIN OUTCOME MEASURES:

Percentage of mono lesion leprosy cases from speci-
fleti age group, sex distribution, adult child distribution
and various mudes of detection.

RESULTS:

267 out of 308 cases are from the younger age group <40
years (87%). There is not much difference in sex
bution (11:9). Aclult child i-alio is 33:17. 90%, of these
cases were detected by active case linding methods.

CONCLUSIONS:

From this stuely, it is concluded that early detection of
mono lesion cases in an urban setup requires an active
case finding method and theretbre should be emphasised.

The Leprosy Mission, 259/A, Acharya Prafulla Chan-
tira Road, Calcinai - 700 006 Phone : (11)91-33-
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A GENETIC STUDY OF LEPROSY :
PEDIGREE PATTERNS AND SEGREGATION
ANALYSIS

Venkal Rani Reddy, Melier Vani,
Gopal Reddy^Sujai .S'unceilia,

Lepra India, Hyderabad

Pedigree analysis provides information on genetic de-
termination of susceptibility to infeetious diseases.
Segregationanalysis on pedigrees can suggest the Imi-
temoí inheritance of susceptibility gene/s. Generally.
the transmission panem of disease within a pedigree is
compared to a variety of transmission models to ascer-
tain whether it lias a dominam. recessive or co-doini-
nant panem.

In tios prospective study, we questioned 28 leprosy pa-
tients who had 2 or more members in the family af-
lected by leprosy and their pedigree patterns wcre
drawn upto isso generations. The study was carried ou)
ai Dhoolpet Leprosy Research Centre, which is an ou)
patient clinic where patients are self-drawn or referred
for diagnosis and treatment of leprosy.

'lhe results show 1 family with six members, 1 with
live members. 7 with three members and 17 with to
members affected. The ixttterll of affected versus unaf-
fected within the generation was 69:114 (1:1.7). The
mean sibship size was 5. We found eonsiderable spar-
ing of the disease among siblings. The panem ol. :tf-
feeted versus unaffected among siblings was 42:86
(1:2). Across the generation in 4 pedigrees. uncles
were affected. The proportion of females and males af-
fecteel in the pedigrees were 24:43 (1:1.8). Consan-
guinity as another variahle was noted in 4 pedigrees.
Segregat hm analysis suggests that in 76% of the pedi-
grees, a dominant inheritance pattern was present and
in 24% ()I' the pedigrees. the pattern was undetermined.

Detailed analysis of different pedigree patterns in rela-
tion to segregation. type of leprosy and other variables
will be presented.

Lepra lndia. Blue Peter Research Centre, Cherlapally,
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RANDOM EXANIINATION AND ITS
IMPLICATIONS IN THE VACCINE TRIAL IN
THE NEW LEPROSY SCENARIO

R.L.J.De Brata, N.1.11hayakoinaran, 5. À inoan. Mtary
Alallika. B.Srialutt: IV.Ranitichandrall, R.(rpillath c_Ç
41.1).Glipte Chennai

In the vaccine irial, paramedical workers are supposed
to screen ali the individuais with an expected inini-
main coverage of 90% examination in all the vil lages.
About 10% til total population were supposecl to be
examined according to the ranclontly house-
holds by a medicai examiner or a senior worker. They
sei II examine ali the available individuais vdto 11:111 no
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evidence of leprosy according to the paramedical
workers diagnosis.

With the advent of Multi Drug Therapy from 1986 and
its dramatic intluence over leprosy disease. the reduc-
tion of prevalence/incidence rates is seen almost ali
over the country. As such a similar trend lias to he re-
flected in our data from the vaccine trial. Numher of
new or inissed cases is likely to be substantially low
after the intake and the two resurveys. This is likely
hecause with a lesser prevalence /incidence rate cou-
pled with vaccine efticacy, the transmission rate of dis-
case of leprosy also need to be minimal in the vaccine
trial arca. The paramedical workers were inissing con-
siderahle [mulher of cases during intake perimi as as-
sessed by the random checking of non-cases.

The impacts of random examination in lhe changed
scenario of leprosy and sensitivity and speciticity lev-
eis are studied with the available data. The role of ran-
dom examination in maintaining the sensitivity and
speciticity leveis anil iIs continuance May be dis-
cussed.
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Fim DEMIOLOGICALANALYSIS OF I,EPROSY
IN JIANGSU PROVINCE

\Chen Ning, Shao Suide & Yu Ilao, Jiangsu Provincial
Instilute Of Dermatology, Nanjing, China

To analyze epiderniological trends of leprosy in
Jiangsu Province and provide the scientific basis for
formulating the strategies aiming at eradication of lep-
rosy. Leprosy records and the relevam data were used
for the analysis. Jiangsu Province is a former leprosy-
endemic arca where leprosy was prevalent in 100%, of
cotim ies/cities or 90.9% of townships with ai uneven
distribution of the disease in the past. Leprosy control
was initiated in 1950s in Jiangsu Province. Through
efforts for near 50 years. a lot of leprosy cases were
cured and the prevalence, incidence and detection rates
have decreased to 0.5 per 100000 population. There
were no child cases in lhe past 3 years. By the end of
1998, there were 306 active leprosy cases. Jiangsu
Province has achieved the basic elimination of leprosy
in terms of county and passed the evaluation of Min-
istry of Healt h.

Jiangsu Provincial Institute Of Dermatology, Nanjing,
Jiangsu Province, 210008, China

Phone : 0086-25-3356148
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THE CONTRASTIVE ANAINSIS OF 87 CASES
11F,TWEEN THE INFECTIOUS SOURCE,: OF
LEPROSY AND THE FINDING MANNER

Ge Zhaola & Wang Bitu), Dennatosis Control Hospi-
tal Of Jianliu County. Jiangsti. China

Objective : To approach the relationship between the
infectious source anil occurence of leprosy to finil new
patients in early stage in time.

Methods : Analysing and reviewing patients individual
records which were newly notei! fnmi 1980 to 1999.
47 cases (54.02%) had definhe source of infection and
40 cases (45.98%1 had not. 51 cases were found pas-
sively in clinics and 36 cases were found actively.

Conclusions : MB patients were the major source of
infection. Finding patients actively should have aim.
We should strengthen examining diseases profession-
ally anil reporting disease in net work.

Dermatosis Control Hospital Of Jianliu County,
Jiangsu -224700, China Phone : 0086-515-6213209
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EFIDFRN0oLoGy oF LEFRosv THROUGH
1985-1999 IN SHENZHEN

Dr.Jun Xin Iluang, Drllua^1),:flu Pei Yang,

1)1: Wang Quan IhnIg ShenZhen lnstitute Of Dermatol-
ogy. ShenZhen. China

OBJECTIVE : To study the epidermiology of leprosy
in Shenzhen.

METHOD : Total 87 cases of reported registered lep-
rosy were analyzed among population with Shenzhen
permanent residence and temporary residence from
198510 1999.

RESULTS AND CONCLUSIONS : II was shown that:
38 cases were from population with Shenzhen perimi-
nent residence, making up 43.7. and 49 cases were
those with temporary residence, making up 56.3%,
with inale : female proportion 2.6 : I, majoritv of them

are from 20 to 39 years old. The type is inainly of pau-
eillary, making 57.5%. However. those with temporary
residence saw a 47% incidence rate of 11111Itibacillary,
apparently higher in proportion than Mose with penna-
nent residence. There was a low early discovery rate,
seeing only ah 71.3%; There was a high initial clinie
disability and deformity rate, seeing 17.24%; low reg-
ular treatinent rate for patients with temporary resi-
dence. at 79.4% and a high non-track rate at 20.6%.
The author maintains that: with the economic develop-
mem, there is a sharp growth of population in the Spe-
cial Economic Zone anil a year hy year increase of
flow-in labor. which brings about accordingly notable
birth of new incidence of leprosy This is accompanied
by augrnented possibility of dissemination, as the la-
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borers dou t have a stable working and livimit condi-
tion. In this regard, we should, carry out forceful
health educado]) ou prevention and treatment of lep-
rosy other than the government s care and support,
training the professional team ou the prevention and
treatment of leprosy, enhance the quality of profes-
sionals and foster a strong sense ou detecting leprosy
to ensure an early discovery. early diagnosis and early
treatment. In the meantime, we SI101.11C1 take corre-
sponding measures considering the characteristics of
leprosy with temporary residence and implement com-
prehensive management to recuperate the sick physi-
cally, mentally and socially.

ShenZhen Institute Of Dermatology, 2021 BuXin RI),
ShenZhen, Guang Dong, China Phone : 0086-755-
561878!

Fax : 0086-755-5608380

Email : szzlioulia@sz.gd.cninfo.net
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ALL THE ELEVEN MEMBERS OF TWO
FAMILIES SUFFERED FROM LEPROSY
SUCCESSIVELY

Zou Tall & Zhang Huanyon,:; #

Guizhou South-West Prefectural Institute Of Derma-
tology & Venereology, Guizhou, China # Xingren
County Station For Skin Disease Prevention, Guizhou,
Chi na

A high incidence rate of leprosy among the household
contacts of patients with leprosy lias been generally
recognized. But it was rarely seen that two families of
11 members all contracted leprosy. The authors re-
porte(' that within the period of 20 years afiei- the oc-
currence of the first leprosy case in each oh two fami-
lies, ali their 9 household contacts suffered from
leprosy successively without exception, indicating the
significam importance of regular monitoring leprosy
household contacts in early case detection, early treat-
ment and interruption transmission of the disease.

126 Gulouxidajie, Beijing - 100009, China Phone
0086-10-64950216
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SURVEY OF NEWLY DIAGNOSE) LEPROSY
PATIEN'I'S IN JAPAN

Norihisa Ishii,^Maisuo, Moioaki Ozaki &
Yoshiyuki Kusakabe Leprosy Research Centre, Tokyo,
Japan

We anal yzed the medica' and social problems of newly
registered leprosy patients in the past 19 years from
1981 to 1999 in a low endemic country, Japim. There
were 378 registered Japanese patients (males, 229; fe-
males, 149), and 102 registered foreign patients
(males, 74; females. 26; sex unknown. 2). The number
of Japanese patients in each 5-year period was 187 (
81- 85). 119 ( 86- 90). 48 ( 91- 95). and 24 ( 96- 99, 4
years), and lias been decreasing steadily. 13ut the num-
ber of foreign patients iii each 5-year period was 7, 10,
45, and 40, respectively. and has been increasing. The
number of foreign patients was greater than that of
Japanese patients in the 'atter hal'. 1991-1999. The
male/female ratio was 229/149 in Japanese patients,
and 74/26 in forei211 patients. Male/female ratio
decreased among the Japanese but increased among
foreigners.

Newly registered leprosy patients in Japan 1 mito
1999)

Nationality^Sex^81,82,83,84,85^86,87,88,89,90
91,92.93,94,95 96,97,98,99 Total

Japanese

M 32,14,21,20,25 21,14,17,16, 9 6,6,7,2,5 3,2,3,6 229
F 15,16,13,15,16 13,6,9,8,6 8,3 .1,7,3 3,3,2,2 149 M&F
47,30,34,35,41 34,20,26,24,15 14,9. 8,9, 8 6,5,5,8 378

81-85:187 86-90:11991-95:48 96-99:24

Foreigners

M 0,0,3,0,1 1,2,1.3,1 5,8,9,4,9 12.7.2,6 74 F 0,1,0.0.2
0,0.0,0,2 2,4.1,2,1 4,2,3,2 26 ?* 2 2 M&F 0,1,3,0,3
1.2.1.3,3 7.12.1(1,6,10 18,9,5,8 102

81-85:7 86-90:10 91-95:45 96-99:40 " Sex unknown

Leprosy Research Centre, NIID, Aobacho, Higashiniu-
rayama, Tokyo„lapan Phone : 0081-42-3918062

Fax : 0081-42-3918776

Email : norishii@nih.go.jp
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POPULATION SCREENING AND
EVALUATION OF PROPHYLACTIC
TREATMENT FOR CONTACTS IN LEPROSY
HYPERENDEMIC ARFAS

Miriam Bakker Alahanunc(l Mata, Paul Klaiser &
Linda °skarn

Royal Tropical Institute (KIT), Amsterdam, The
Netherlands

Ou live sinal! islands in Indonesia (South Sulawesi
Province) 3987 persons of a total population of 4770
persons (coverage 84%) were screene41 for leprosy in
June-July 2000.

A total of 91 new leprosy cases were diagnosed, repre-
sentim) an overall case detection rate of 2.3%, ranging
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from 1.2% to 5.0% per island. The overall prevalence
rate was 191 per 10,000, ranging from 87 to 442 per
10,000 per island. Of ali patients, 46% was classified
as MB, 40% as PB single lesion and 14% as PB 2-5 le-
sions. Children below 15 ycars represented 9% of the
patients and those with WHO grade 2 disability 11%.

Of ali patients, 68 (75%) were clustered, where clus-
tering is detined as a group of at least two patients who
either fali in each other s contact group or share the
same contacts. In this study, contacts are defined as
household contacts, immediate neighbours and next
neighbours. Further analysis of patients and general
population data is currently ongoing and will be pre-
sented.

On ali islands, the leprosy patients were treated with
MDT according to the national guidelines. To be able
to study two different regimens for prophylactic treat-
ment (blanket treatment and contact treatment) and to
have a control group, the three small islands (Pelokan,
Kembanglemari and Tampaan) were cCuribined and
served as one group (1252 inhahitants, 39 leprosy
cases). The two bigger islands, Sapuka (2069 inhabi-
tants, 26 leprosy cases) and Sailus (1449 inhabitants,
26 leprosy cases) each served as one group. Sailus
served as control island, where only the patients were
treated with MDT. On the group of three small islands
79% of the population (persons without leprosy; above
5 years and without contraindication) received prophy-
lactic treatment with rifampicin. On Sapuka contacts
of patients (householtl contacts, immediate neighbours
and next neighbours), 17% of the population, received
prophylactic treatment. During the delivery of the pro-
phylactic treatment of both groups 73% took the med-
ication direct (under supervision) and 27% indirect.
This prophylactic treatment will be repeated after 4 to
5 months.

During screening (intravenous) blood and nasal-swabs
were collected of everybody above live years. This (in-
cluding the screening) will be repeated every year for
the coming three years. This will enable us to follow-
up the effects of the different regimens for prophylac-
tic treatment on the incidence and transmission of lep-
rosy.

Department of Biomedical Research, Royal Tropical
Institute (KIT), Meibergdreef 39, 1105 AZ, Amster-
dant, The Netherlands

Phone : 0031-20-5665446

Fax : 0031-20-6971841
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COMPARISON OF OCCURRANCE OF
LEPROSY AMONG CONTACTS AND
GENERAL POPULATION

V.Prasada Rao, Dr.B.PI?avi muar & Mrs.Rahut
Philip Philadelphia Leprosy Hospital, Salur, Andhra
Pradesh

Objectives

1. To desenhe the demographic characteristics of lep-
rosy cases detected from contacts and general popa la-
tion.

2. To study case yield in contacts and non-contacts.

Design

Comparative retrospective study. All the contacts who
were registered fmm 1997 to 1999 and general popu-
lation are taken imo account.

Settings

Ali leprosy cases from contacts and general population
are taken. Study has taken into account records avail-
able with Leprosy Control Unit, Philadelphia Leprosy
Hospital, Salur of Andhra Pradesh.

Main indicators and outcome measures

Case yield between contacts and general population is
com pared.

Results

1. Case yield from contacts is : 2. Case yield from non
contacts is : No. of cases among contacts = 0.57% No.
of cases = 0.20%

Total no. of contacts Total population examined

Conclusion

Case yield from contacts is approximately three times
higher than non-contacts. It vai dates the need for mo-
tivation and careful examination of ali contacts and
also proves the contacts are at a higher risk of devei-
oping disease.

Philadelphia Leprosy Hospital, Salur - 535 591,
Vizianagarain District, AntIhra Praclesh Phone : 0091-
8964-52320

Fax : 0091-8964-52310

Email : tImsalur@satyam.net.in
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KALA-AZAR PKIW) IN LEPROSY ENDEMIC
REGION

0.Abrahant, Dr.N.Appa Roo, DrG.Rtonakri viloa Roi'',
Dr1:Prahhokra Roo & DrP.Krishnomorikv

Damien Foundation Incha Trust, Chcnnai

Dharbanga distriet in Bihar, lndia is known to be en-
demic for Leprosy and Kala-Azar. Post Kala-Azar
Derma! Leishmaniasis (PKDL) is also common in this
region. Many people with PKDL present with multiple
hypo-pigmented skin patches (flat or raised) resem-
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